
  
 

Ref: FOI/00024/CMICB 
22 August 2022 
  
Your Request: 

 
1) The number of patients NEWLY diagnosed with a) Depression b) 
Anxiety c) ADHD in the years: 
 
i. 2018 
ii. 2019 
iii. 2020 
vi. 2021 
v. 2022 to date  

 
Our Response: 
 

1) Please find listed below the data held by each of the former CCGs that now 
make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to the number of patients 
newly diagnosed with depression, anxiety and ADHD between 2018 and 2022 
to date. 
 
Cheshire  
 

  2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 

Depression 15,233 16,282 16,044 16,043 8,907 

Anxiety 17,421 18,759 11,516 20,745 6,860 

ADHD 741 820 776 1,193 1,088 

 
Halton & Warrington  
Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 

 

Knowsley 
Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 
 

Liverpool  
 

  2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 

Depression 12582 12634 13698 14325 8309 

Anxiety 14264 1447 9397 16180 5362 

ADHD 514 577 685 940 636 
 

Sefton  
Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 
 

St Helens  
 

  2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 

Depression 7107 7660 6995 7457 5012 

Anxiety 8276 9540 7328 8067 5349 
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ADHD 298 344 448 604 448 
 

Wirral  
 

  2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 

Depression 9775 9926 9214 9840 5401 

Anxiety 8458 8567 5583 9908 3193 

ADHD 666 687 609 836 610 
 
Your Request: 

 

2) The number of patients (ALL) with a) Depression b) Anxiety c) ADHD in 
the years: 
 
i. 2018 
ii. 2019 
iii. 2020 
vi. 2021 
v. 2022 to date  
 

Our Response: 
 

2) Please find listed below the data held by each of the former CCGs that now 
make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to the number of all 
patients diagnosed with depression, anxiety and ADHD between 2018 and 2022 
to date. 
Cheshire 
  

  2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 

Depression 34,484 35,873 33,239 34,294 22,856 

Anxiety 22,527 24,340 17,296 16,923 10,779 

ADHD 5,712 6,430 7,067 8,219 9,199 
 

Halton & Warrington  
Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 
 

Knowsley 
Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 
 

Liverpool  
 

  2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 

Depression 28552 28703 28935 30502 21068 

Anxiety 17262 17668 12654 12371 7522 

ADHD 3959 4530 5118 5918 6477 
 

Sefton  
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Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 
 

St Helens  
 

  2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 

Depression 36716 37930 39235 40629 41382 

Anxiety 35532 38328 39939 41810 42840 

ADHD 1165 1312 1520 1861 2073 
 

Wirral  
 

  2018 2019 2020 2021 2022 

Depression 19996 20421 18595 19674 13142 

Anxiety 10257 10577 7643 7679 4715 

ADHD 5675 6316 845 7380 7924 
 
Your Request: 

 

3) The average wait time between referral and treatment for a) Depression 
b) Anxiety c) ADHD in the years: 
 

i. 2018 
ii. 2019 
iii. 2020 
vi. 2021 
v. 2022 to date 

Our Response: 
 

3) Please find listed below the data held by each of the former CCGs that now 
make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to the average wait time 
between referral and treatment for depression, anxiety and ADHD between 
2018 and 2022 to date. 
 
Cheshire  
Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 
 
Halton & Warrington  
Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 
 

Knowsley 
Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 
 

Liverpool  
3a – b) Information not held. However, there is historic There is historic data 
published via the NHS Digital website which can be accessed at: 
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 https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-information/publications/statistical/psychological-
therapies-report-on-the-use-of-iapt-services/  (LCCG is 99A and RW4 is our 
provider). 
 
Talk Liverpool, also publish their latest wait times in more detail here 
https://www.talkliverpool.nhs.uk/trusted-partners/performance-data/ 
 
3c) This data was not collected for 2018 -2019. Validated data only held for 
October 2020 and October 2021 which is listed below: 
 
October 2020 = 139 Weeks 
October 2021 = 160 Weeks 

 

Sefton  
Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 
 

St Helens  
Information not held – please redirect to commissioned providers who may hold 
this level of data*. 
 

Wirral  
Data relating to Adult ADHD waiting times held only and listed below: 
- 2019: 23 weeks. 
- 2020: 92 weeks. 
- 2021: 79 weeks. 
- 2022: 120 weeks. 

 

*Please find listed below the commissioned providers of depression, anxiety and 
ADHD referral and treatment services along with their contact details for the 
former CCG areas: 

 
Cheshire  
 
Mid Cheshire Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust (Children) 
foi.foi@mcht.nhs.uk 

 
Countess of Cheshire Hospital NHS Foundation Trust (Children) 
Foi.enquiries@nhs.net 
 
Bridgewater Community Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust (Children) 
bchft.foi@nhs.net 
 
Cheshire & Wirral Partnership NHS Foundation Trust (Children/Adults) 
cwp.foi@nhs.net 

 
Halton & Warrington 
  
North West Boroughs Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust [up to 2020] 

https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-information/publications/statistical/psychological-therapies-report-on-the-use-of-iapt-services/
https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-information/publications/statistical/psychological-therapies-report-on-the-use-of-iapt-services/
https://www.talkliverpool.nhs.uk/trusted-partners/performance-data/
mailto:foi.foi@mcht.nhs.uk
mailto:Foi.enquiries@nhs.net
mailto:bchft.foi@nhs.net
mailto:cwp.foi@nhs.net
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http://www.nwbh.nhs.uk/  
 
Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust [2021 to date] 
FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk  

 
Knowsley 
 
Alder Hey Children’s Foundation Trust (Children) 
FOIRequests@alderhey.nhs.uk  
 
Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust (Adults) 
FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk  
 
Sefton 
 
Alder Hey Children’s Foundation Trust (Children) 
FOIRequests@alderhey.nhs.uk  
 
Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust (Adults) 
FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk  
 
St Helens  

 

-  Bridgewater Community Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust 
   bchft.foi@nhs.net 
 
- St Helens & Knowsley Teaching Hospitals NHS Trust 
  foirequests@sthk.nhs.uk  

http://www.nwbh.nhs.uk/
mailto:FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk
mailto:FOIRequests@alderhey.nhs.uk
mailto:FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk
mailto:FOIRequests@alderhey.nhs.uk
mailto:FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk
mailto:bchft.foi@nhs.net
mailto:foirequests@sthk.nhs.uk

